
 
 
 

 

VISION SCREENING REPORT FORM 
 
 

FOR______________________________________ 
 

 
VISION SCREENING POLICY 
 
Since eighty percent of what children learn comes 
from their eyes and vision, eye care professionals 
believe it is important to detect vision problems 
before they affect a child’s performance at school.  
It is estimated that one in six children have a vision 
problem. 
 
This is a vision screening, and not a complete eye 
examination by a doctor.  It is designed to identify 
children who have trouble seeing things at a 
distance, up close, or who have difficulty making 
both eyes work together.  No attempt will be made 
to check the health of the eyes. 
 
Vision screening does not replace a complete 
examination and it will not identify every child with 
an eye problem.  The Ontario Association of 
Optometrists recommends that every child have 
his/her first eye examination by the age of six 
months and when no abnormalities are detected, 
again at the age of three.  Annual eye examinations 
are recommended for school aged children and are 
covered by OHIP. 
 
If your family does not have a vision care 
examination provider, please contact an optometrist 
in your area. 
 
 
Optometrists are dedicated to providing quality 

primary eye care. 
 

THE LIONS/LIONESS CLUBS OF 
DISTRICT A- 16 
 
are pleased to present this vision screening report. 
 

SCREENING 
CRITERIA 

PASS Further Investigation 
Advised 

 
Far Visual Acuity 
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Refraction 

 
______ 

 
______ 

 
 
_________Your child has passed all the components 
of the vision screening. 
 
 
_________Your child may have a vision problem 
and should have a complete eye and vision 
examination. 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
Examiner 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
Date 
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